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Answers

1. 2,271

2. 1,854

3. 1,262

4. 1,637

5. 1,744

6. 1,633

7. 1,856

8. 1,998

9. 1,460

10. 1,724

Solve each problem.

1) While working on his car, Adam spent 466 bucks on a new paint job, $963 on the
transmission and 842 dollars on the interior. How much money did he spend total?

2) A zoologist was checking the weights of three gorillas. Gorilla A weighed 330 pounds,
gorilla B weighed 881 pounds and gorilla C weighed 643 pounds. What is the combined
weight of all three gorillas?

3) Amy was looking through some old photo albums. The first had 127 pics, the second had
725 and the last had 410. How many pictures were there total?

4) For her birthday Katie received 999 dollars from her friends and another 426 dollars from
her family. If she already had 212 dollars, how much money would Katie have total?

5) A chef was buying different soups. She bought 520 cans of chicken soup, 349 cans of
mushroom soup and 875 cans of tomato soup. How many can of soup did she buy all
together?

6) Over the summer Dave earned 154 dollars mowing lawns, another 809 dollars weed eating
and 670 dollars spraying for weeds. How much money did Dave make total?

7) At the dog show there were 795 guests on Friday, 915 on Saturday and 146 on Sunday.
How many people went to the dog show during all three days?

8) Cody collected 3 rocks from his garden. The first was 855 grams, the second was 971
grams and the last was 172 grams. What is the combined weight (in grams) of all three
rocks?

9) For a new year's party 620 red balloons, 290 green balloons and 550 white balloons were
used. What is the total number of balloons used?

10) A grocery store ordered 975 bottles of regular soda, 198 bottles of diet and 551 bottles of
water. What is the total number of bottles the store ordered?
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Solve each problem.

2,271 1,856 1,637 1,633 1,262

1,460 1,724 1,854 1,998 1,744

1) While working on his car, Adam spent 466 bucks on a new paint job, $963 on the
transmission and 842 dollars on the interior. How much money did he spend total?

2) A zoologist was checking the weights of three gorillas. Gorilla A weighed 330 pounds,
gorilla B weighed 881 pounds and gorilla C weighed 643 pounds. What is the combined
weight of all three gorillas?

3) Amy was looking through some old photo albums. The first had 127 pics, the second had
725 and the last had 410. How many pictures were there total?

4) For her birthday Katie received 999 dollars from her friends and another 426 dollars from
her family. If she already had 212 dollars, how much money would Katie have total?

5) A chef was buying different soups. She bought 520 cans of chicken soup, 349 cans of
mushroom soup and 875 cans of tomato soup. How many can of soup did she buy all
together?

6) Over the summer Dave earned 154 dollars mowing lawns, another 809 dollars weed eating
and 670 dollars spraying for weeds. How much money did Dave make total?

7) At the dog show there were 795 guests on Friday, 915 on Saturday and 146 on Sunday.
How many people went to the dog show during all three days?

8) Cody collected 3 rocks from his garden. The first was 855 grams, the second was 971
grams and the last was 172 grams. What is the combined weight (in grams) of all three
rocks?

9) For a new year's party 620 red balloons, 290 green balloons and 550 white balloons were
used. What is the total number of balloons used?

10) A grocery store ordered 975 bottles of regular soda, 198 bottles of diet and 551 bottles of
water. What is the total number of bottles the store ordered?
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